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The book Red Seas Under Red Skies (Gentleman Bastards) By Scott Lynch will certainly constantly give
you favorable worth if you do it well. Finishing guide Red Seas Under Red Skies (Gentleman Bastards) By
Scott Lynch to read will not become the only goal. The objective is by getting the favorable worth from the
book up until the end of the book. This is why; you should learn more while reading this Red Seas Under
Red Skies (Gentleman Bastards) By Scott Lynch This is not just just how fast you check out a publication
and not only has how many you finished guides; it has to do with exactly what you have actually gotten from
the books.

From Publishers Weekly
Like its roguish protagonists, Lynch's colorful sequel to 2006's The Lies of Locke Lamora is charming,
unpredictable and fast on its feet and stands surprisingly well on its own given its convoluted plot. Initially
poised to rob the Sinspire, the notoriously thief-proof casino where the penalty for cheating is death, Locke
and his partner, Jean, are unwillingly sidetracked into joining and then leading a pirate crew, swindling their
way across the sea as they had previously done on land. The cinematic influences on Lynch's fantasy setting
are evident, the borrowing is mostly ingenious and the prose frequently enthralls, but tone and pacing suffer
from odd inconsistencies. A handful of dark moments clash uncomfortably with the overall devil-may-care
atmosphere. Most frustrating of all is the handling of key secondary character Ezri Delmastro, who shines
too briefly as an energetic romantic interest for Jean. The ending promises at least one more installment, but
fans may be unhappy if the saga strays too far from its amiable roots. (Aug.)
Copyright © Reed Business Information, a division of Reed Elsevier Inc. All rights reserved.

From Booklist
*Starred Review* The science-fiction caper novel constitutes a small genre to begin with (Keith Laumer and
Harry Harrison may be its best-known names), but Lynch added something entirely new to it with his debut,
The Lies of Locke Lamora (2006). That novel, which told the story of a young boy taken under the wing of a
master thief, was set on a distant planet but at a stage in the planet's history roughly equivalent to our own
pirate age. Now Locke, the talented boy who became a world-class thief, returns with a caper so big it defies
all reason—to penetrate the vault of the Sinspire, the most protected casino on the planet, and take its
contents. If the first novel had undercurrents of Oliver Twist, this one is more in the vein of Ocean's Eleven
or The Sting: fast paced, colorful, funny, with a fiendishly intricate plot containing plenty of right-angle
turns. Locke and his partner, Jean, trade banter like Redford and Newman and work their light-fingered
magic with charm and panache. Lynch hasn't merely imagined a far-off world, he's created it, put it all down
on paper—the smells, the sounds, the people, the feel of the place. The novel is a virtuoso performance, and
sf/fantasy fans will gobble it up, though they'll have to fight with caper novel aficionados for every crumb.
Pitt, David

Review
PRAISE FOR SCOTT LYNCH



 
“A bright new voice in the fantasy genre.”—George R. R. Martin
 
Red Seas Under Red Skies
 
“Lynch hasn’t merely imagined a far-off world, he’s created it, put it all down on paper—the smells, the
sounds, the people, the feel of the place. The novel is a virtuoso performance, and sf/fantasy fans will gobble
it up.”—Booklist (starred review)
 
“Red Seas Under Red Skies firmly proves that Scott Lynch isn’t a one-hit wonder. . . . It’ll only be a matter
of time before Scott Lynch is mentioned in the same breath as George R. R. Martin and Steven
Erikson.”—Fantasy Book Critic
 
“Grand, grandiose, grandiloquent . . . No critic is likely to fault Lynch in his overflowing qualities of
inventiveness, audacious draftsmanship, and sympathetic characterization.”—Locus
 
“The kind of witty romp that reminds you exactly how much fun heroic fantasy is supposed to be.”—SFX

The Lies of Locke Lamora
 
“Right now, in the full flush of a second reading, I think The Lies of Locke Lamora is probably in my top ten
favorite books ever. Maybe my top five. If you haven’t read it, you should. If you have read it, you should
probably read it again.”—Patrick Rothfuss, New York Times bestselling author of The Name of the Wind
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In his highly acclaimed debut, The Lies of Locke Lamora, Scott Lynch took us on an adrenaline-fueled
adventure with a band of daring thieves led by con artist extraordinaire Locke Lamora. Now Lynch brings
back his outrageous hero for a caper so death-defying, nothing short of a miracle will pull it off.

After a brutal battle with the underworld that nearly destroyed him, Locke and his trusted sidekick, Jean, fled
the island city of their birth and landed on the exotic shores of Tal Verrar to nurse their wounds. But even at
this westernmost edge of civilization, they can’t rest for long—and are soon back to what they do best:
stealing from the undeserving rich and pocketing the proceeds for themselves.

This time, however, they have targeted the grandest prize of all: the Sinspire, the most exclusive and heavily
guarded gambling house in the world. Its nine floors attract the wealthiest clientele—and to rise to the top,
one must impress with good credit, amusing behavior…and excruciatingly impeccable play. For there is one
cardinal rule, enforced by Requin, the house’s cold-blooded master: it is death to cheat at any game at the
Sinspire.

Brazenly undeterred, Locke and Jean have orchestrated an elaborate plan to lie, trick, and swindle their way
up the nine floors…straight to Requin’s teeming vault. Under the cloak of false identities, they meticulously
make their climb—until they are closer to the spoils than ever.

But someone in Tal Verrar has uncovered the duo’s secret. Someone from their past who has every intention
of making the impudent criminals pay for their sins. Now it will take every ounce of cunning to save their
mercenary souls. And even that may not be enough.…
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Most helpful customer reviews

6 of 6 people found the following review helpful.
Too Many Competing Plot Lines
By Robin Snyder
I really enjoyed the first book in this series but Red Seas Under Red Skies was a bit meh for me.

Don’t get me wrong, the dialogue between Locke and Jean is still amazing and I love the utter devotion those
two have for one another. But the story was a little all over the place and I think my biggest issue is probably
that the flashbacks were to a time not that long ago instead of when they were growing up gentlemen
bastards. So things got a little but jumbly

***“Know something? I'd lay even odds that between the people following us and the people hunting us,
we've become this city's principle means of employment. Tal Verrar's entire economy is now based on
messing with us.”***

And therein lies the problem. They aren’t between a rock and a hard place but A Rock, A hard place, A cliff
and an erupting volcano. There are too many adversaries and sub plots and side scams and….well I think you
get what I’m saying.

I found myself getting really distracted. I’d read a little bit and then I’d wonder off into another book or three
before I remembered to come back to it. It took me forever to get through the section that involved learning



how to fake being a pirate.

? The + side ?

☞ - Locke and Jean are ever entertaining. They have a great bromance and even though they have been
through some tough times they are still like brothers.

☞ - There are always strong women in this and I was happy to see that the pirates are equal opportunity
employers and there were a fair share of deadly female pirates.

☞ - The world building is really wonderful with all the alchemical concoctions and such as well as the
deadly and cruel games that the nobility of different lands like to play. I will never look at a chess game in
quite the same way after this.

? The - side ?

☛ - Took way too long to get anywhere in the story. With far too many overlapping plot lines. It was a little
hard to follow who was on whose side and how they were messing with Locke and Jean.

☛ - There was no Sabatha. Look we didn’t really get to see her in the first book but I was thinking she is
Locke’s long lost love and I keep thinking she is going to pop up sometime….but she didn’t. I wish I would
have known that going into this book.

☛ - The ending. Well it was unexpected that things played out like they did. I will give Scott Lynch that but
idk it made most of the story seem a bit pointless to me.

Overall:

The writing and dialogue is really good I just don’t think I liked the story all that much. But this is maybe a
story that you like better the second time you read through it since you knew where things are going.

6 of 6 people found the following review helpful.
If nautical nonsense be somethin' you wish...
By The Mad Alchemist
I bought this book when I was less than 200 pages into The Lies of Locke Lamora. I adored it; the world, the
characters, the intricacies of the cons. It was something I didn't know I was looking for until it was in my
hands.

I'd regard the second book as highly if the story that was built up within the first 200 pages is the story we
got. The first chapter was brilliantly written, and spurred me to shirk my adult responsibilities as I was drawn
deeper into the narrative. Fans of the first book knew there was plenty of room for raising the stakes, and it
seemed as though Red Seas Under Red Skies would deliver on that.

Unfortunately the main plot - as well as all the characters I'd grown to care about - were told to bugger off
around 300 pages in while Locke and Jean meandered out to sea.

I'm torn. I don't hate everything about the middle section of the book, and though I wish the story had gone
in another direction (primarily because there were too many plotlines and too many things that weren't
followed up on or not given nearly as much development as I'd have liked), I can see why Lynch went in the



direction he did.

The book's biggest problem is that you could cut around 200 pages of content and wind up with a much
stronger product. All the time spent on explaining sailing and nautical terms and this and that was time I'd
have rather spent reading about the intricacies of a new con, or delving deeper into Locke's backstory.

It didn't help that time skipped about however it wished. There's a particularly bad instance at the beginning
of chapter eleven where the narrative jumps forward by several hours following the last chapter, but then the
second scene goes right back to the end of the last chapter without warning, and it took me a minute to figure
out what was happening. Confusion mixed with long passages about things I don't care about do not make
for a pleasant time.

I'll say this - Lynch did a marvelous job of describing things I don't care about. He simply couldn't make it
interesting in a context where it ground the main plot to a halt.

I can't help but get the feeling he felt so much pressure to up the stakes following a first novel where things
went to hell in fantastic fashion that he went too far with this one and couldn't keep the plot focused as a
result. It's not a bad book by any means, but the best parts largely copy the formula from the first book, and
the second act lull is long and dull enough I had to flip back to earlier pages to remind myself what was
going on when the plot kicked back into gear.

If you haven't read The Lies of Locke Lamora, pick it up. It's well worth your coin. If you enjoy the banter
between Locke and Jean, Red Seas Under Red Skies is worth a look. The dialog is as sharp as ever, and
despite my overall feelings about the tale, I love the characters more than I did going into it.

If you enjoyed Lies more for the con, the consistent pacing, the gradual escalation of the main threat, and the
steady build that led to an explosive (and immensely satisfying) conclusion, you'll find some of that here, but
it's not going to thrill you half as much as the first book. You could skip from chapter seven to chapter
thirteen or fourteen and not miss much of importance.

Lynch is a solid writer and world builder. He has a great vision for this series, but for whatever reason things
didn't quite gel in this entry. I'm going to read the third book despite seeing several middling reviews because
the characters and the world are strong enough to keep me hooked despite the flaws, but I have to admit parts
of Red Seas Under Red Skies were slogs nearly on par with the sections of Lord of the Rings where Tolkien
was so charmed by a particular arrangement of stones or trees he had to write about them for several pages,
or have characters sing for whole chapters. This isn't a book for the casual Locke Lamora/fantasy enthusiast.

0 of 0 people found the following review helpful.
Pretty good
By Heather M. Head
For me, this was a let-down after the first Locke Lamora book. Where the first captured and held my
attention from the first moment, this one was slow to gain speed, and, once it did, was so full of complexities
and plots within plots and characters within characters that I had a hard time staying with it. Once the main
characters get on the ship and develop interesting relationships with the interesting characters there, it speeds
up and becomes interesting, but it takes half the book to get there. And then, before it's over with again, the
reader is forced to return to the mind-exhausting complexity of plots within plots in order to make sense of
the ending.

I still give it 4 stars because I love this character and several of the secondary characters, and the good parts



were worth wading through the meh parts. However, I will probably not read the third book, as I fear it is
likely to be equally or even more complex, and ... I'd rather spend time with characters than plot twists.

See all 732 customer reviews...
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